
0 30

1

4132703
Flint Hills Resources, LP
7075 N 14th Ave
Omaha, NE 68112

Abby Rauwald
402-660-6270
402-403-4357

abby.rauwald@fhr.com

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid



No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

$475.50

$555.00

$526.50

$2,840.161.50

$180,375.00

$1,413,652.50



No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

$509.50 $830,485.00



No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid



No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

$0.00 $0.00

$0.00 $0.00

















































FH
R

w
illIndem

nify
the

state
to

the
extentarising

outofFH
R

's
fault.









FH
R

intends
to

use
third

party
trucking

to
deliver

m
aterials

as
in

the
past.







FH
R

w
illonly

assign
claim

s
to

the
extentFH

R
passed

on
those

overcharges
to

the
state.











































Allprices
w

illbe
firm

forthe
duration

ofthe
contract.

N
o

increases
w

illbe
sought

nordecreases
applied.





FlintH
ills

R
esources,LP

7075
N

14th
Ave

O
m

aha,N
E

68112

C
harles

Boan-G
eneralM

anager
C

harles.Boan@
fhr.com

402-403-4357
612-840-9143

402-341-8737





A
D

D
EN

D
U

M
 O

N
E, R

EVISED
 SC

H
ED

U
LE O

F EVEN
TS

D
ate:

February 17,2021

To:
All Bidders 

From
:

Brenda Sensibaugh, Buyer
AS M

ateriel Purchasing 

R
E:

Addendum
 for ITB 6457

O
F

to be opened
February

25, 2021
at 2:00 p.m

. C
entral 

Schedule of Events

The State expects to adhere to the tentative procurem
ent schedule show

n below
.  It should be noted, 

how
ever, that som

e dates are approxim
ate and subject to change.  It is the Bidder’s responsibility to check 

the State Purchasing Bureau w
ebsite

for all addenda oram
endm

ents.

A
C

TIVITY
D

A
TE/TIM

E

R
elease  ITB

2-3-21

Last day to subm
it w

ritten questions

U
pload electronic subm

issions via ShareFile to:

https://nebraska.sharefile.com
/r-

ra4f9b83022c5400dbb963539f3a116d1

2-12-21

State responds to w
ritten questions through a solicitation 

“Addendum
” and/or “Am

endm
ent” to be posted to the Internet at:

http://das.nebraska.gov/m
ateriel/purchasing.htm

l

2-19-21
2-15-21



Page 2

A
C

TIVITY
D

A
TE/TIM

E
Electronic Bid O

pening

Electronically subm
itted bids are being accepted due to the 

challenges
of C

O
VID

-19.

U
pload electronic subm

issions via ShareFile to:

https://nebraska.sharefile.com
/r-

r24eda36eb2f14de8bfd2ed0a24dcbe9a

Topic: 6457 O
F

R
oad O

il Bid O
pening

Tim
e: Jan 21, 2021February 25, 2021 02:00 PM

 C
entral Tim

e (U
S 

and C
anada)

Join Zoom
 M

eeting

https://us02w
eb.zoom

.us/j/2629176739?pw
d=N

khobXN
pO

U
94U

m
F

m
TG

1w
Ym

JqTXhpU
T09

M
eeting ID

: 262 917 6739

Passcode: 5Vw
BuR

IT IS TH
E B

ID
D

ER
’S R

ESPO
N

SIB
ILTY TO

 U
PLO

A
D

 
ELEC

TR
O

N
IC

 FILES W
ITH

 EN
O

U
G

H
 A

M
O

U
N

T O
F TIM

E IN
 

C
A

SE O
F U

SER
 ISSU

E O
R

 SO
FTW

A
R

E ISSU
E.

2-25-21
2:00 PM

C
entral Tim

e

Post “N
otification of Intent to Aw

ard” to Internet at: 
http://das.nebraska.gov/m

ateriel/purchasing.htm
l

TBD

This Addendum
 w

ill becom
e part of the proposal and should be acknow

ledged w
ith the ITB.



 
A

D
D

EN
D

U
M

 TW
O

, R
EVISED

 SC
H

ED
U

LE O
F EVEN

TS 
 D

ate: 
 

February 22, 2021 
 To: 

 
All Bidders  

 From
: 

 
Brenda Sensibaugh, Buyer 
AS M

ateriel Purchasing  
 

R
E: 

 
Addendum

 for ITB 6457 O
F to be opened M

arch 5, 2021 at 2:00 p.m
. C

entral  
  

Schedule of Events 
 The State expects to adhere to the tentative procurem

ent schedule show
n below

.  It should be noted, 
how

ever, that som
e dates are approxim

ate and subject to change.  It is the Bidder’s responsibility to check 
the State Purchasing Bureau w

ebsite for all addenda or am
endm

ents. 
 

A
C

TIVITY 
D

A
TE/TIM

E 

R
elease  ITB 

2-3-21 

Last day to subm
it w

ritten questions 

 U
pload electronic subm

issions via ShareFile to: 

 https://nebraska.sharefile.com
/r-

ra4f9b83022c5400dbb963539f3a116d1 
 

2-12-21 

State responds to w
ritten questions through a solicitation 

“Addendum
” and/or “Am

endm
ent” to be posted to the Internet at: 

http://das.nebraska.gov/m
ateriel/purchasing.htm

l 

2-24-21 
2-19-21 
2-15-21 



Page 2 

A
C

TIVITY 
D

A
TE/TIM

E 
Electronic Bid O

pening 
 Electronically subm

itted bids are being accepted due to the 
challenges of C

O
VID

-19. 
 U

pload electronic subm
issions via ShareFile to: 

 https://nebraska.sharefile.com
/r-

r24eda36eb2f14de8bfd2ed0a24dcbe9a 
  Topic: 6457 O

F R
oad O

il Bid O
pening 

Tim
e: Jan 21, 2021February 25, 2021 M

arch 5, 2021  02:00 PM
 

C
entral Tim

e (U
S and C

anada) 

 Join Zoom
 M

eeting 

https://us02w
eb.zoom

.us/j/2629176739?pw
d=N

khobXN
pO

U
94U

m
F

m
TG

1w
Ym

JqTXhpU
T09 

 M
eeting ID

: 262 917 6739 

Passcode: 5Vw
BuR

 

  IT IS TH
E B

ID
D

ER
’S R

ESPO
N

SIB
ILTY TO

 U
PLO

A
D

 
ELEC

TR
O

N
IC

 FILES W
ITH

 EN
O

U
G

H
 A

M
O

U
N

T O
F TIM

E IN
 

C
A

SE O
F U

SER
 ISSU

E O
R

 SO
FTW

A
R

E ISSU
E. 

3-5-21 
2-25-21 
2:00 PM

 
C

entral Tim
e 

Post “N
otification of Intent to Aw

ard” to Internet at: 
http://das.nebraska.gov/m

ateriel/purchasing.htm
l 

TBD
 

  This Addendum
 w

ill becom
e part of the proposal and should be acknow

ledged w
ith the ITB.  

 



 

 

 
A

D
D

EN
D

U
M

 TH
R

EE,  
Q

U
ESTIO

N
S A

N
D

 A
N

SW
ER

S 
 R

EVISED
 SC

H
ED

U
LE O

F EVEN
TS A

N
D

 R
EVISED

 ITB
   

  D
ate: 

 
2-23-21 

 
 To: 

 
All Bidders  

 From
:  

Brenda Sensibaugh, Buyer 
AS M

ateriel State Purchasing Bureau (SPB) 
 R

E: 
 

Addendum
 for ITB N

um
ber 6457 O

F to be opened February 25-21M
AR

C
H

 5, 2021 C
entral 

Tim
e 

  
Follow

ing are the questions subm
itted and answ

ers provided for the above-m
entioned ITB.  The 

questions and answ
ers are to be considered as part of the ITB.  It is the Bidder’s responsibility to 

check the SPB w
ebsite for all Addenda or Am

endm
ents. 

Q
uestion 

N
um

ber 
6457 O

F 
Section 

R
eference 

6457 O
F 

Page 
N

um
ber 

Q
uestion 

State R
esponse 

1 
 

 
There is not a bid 
item

 for D
em

urrage 
or for the R

eturn 
Load Fee.  W

ill you 
add these to the bid 
docum

ents? 
 

Yes, a line for D
em

urrage has now
 been 

added to the R
evised ITB that has been 

posted w
ith this Addendum

.   
 Yes, R

eturned Load Fee has now
 been 

added to the R
evised ITB that has been 

posted w
ith this Addendum

.   
 Bidders need to ensure, they use the 
revised ITB 6457 O

F for Bidding.  
 

2 
 

 
W

hat w
ere the 

actual tonnages used 
in 2020 by Product 
and by D

istrict 
 

Attachm
ent B- 2020 Product U

sage by 
D

istrict has been created and w
ill be 

added via addendum
 Three.  

 For Bidding, use quantities in revised ITB
 

(see question 3 below
) as the num

bers 
represent estim

ated usage for 2021. 
3 

 
 

W
e w

ould 
recom

m
end you 

m
ake this bid 

docum
ent a little 

easier by only 
having one B

uyer 
Pickup line for each 
product, not lines by 
D

istrict.  It does not 

A R
evised ITB has been posted w

ith this 
Addendum

 to am
end for only having one 

(1) line per product for Plant-Pick U
p. 

U
se the revised ITB 6457 O

F for bidding. 



 

Page 2 

m
atter w

hich 
D

istrict w
ants to 

com
e for a B

uyer 
Pickup load.  The 
sam

e w
ith adding 

D
em

urrage and the 
R

eturn Load Fee.  
O

nly once is 
enough? 
 

4 
G

 
29 

Page 29 Section G
 

Late or N
on 

D
elivery: the line 

“A
ny out of 

specification 
m

aterial w
hich has 

been incorporated 
into the w

ork, 
sections (b), (c), and 
(d) of the B

asis of 
Paym

ent w
ill 

apply.”  There are 
no sections (b), (c), 
or (d).  D

o you just 
m

ean Table 
504.01A

? 
 

Section V, Page 29, Paragraph 2, is 
hereby am

ended to delete/rem
ove “Any 

specification m
ateria l w

hich has been 
incorporated into the w

ork, sections (b), 
(c) and (d) of the basis paym

ent” 
 And 

replaced 
w

ith- 
“Any 

specification 
m

aterial w
hich has been incorporated into 

the w
ork, sections (2), (3) and (4) of the 

basis paym
ent” 

 

5 
 

32 
 Page 32 Special 
Provisions, Section 
A

. Q
uality C

ontrol 
Program

 
C

ertification: It is 
asking for 2018 
certification, don’t 
you w

ant a current 
2021 certification?  
A

lso “John G
ude” 

referenced is no 
longer in that 
D

epartm
ent.  

C
hange to current 

personnel?  A
lso 

applies to Section B
 

on the sam
e page. 

 

Section V, Special Provisions for Liquid 
Asphalt M

aterials 
 Section A, Paragraph 2- Suppliers w

ho do 
not 

have 
a 

current 
2018 

approval 
is 

hereby am
ended to “2021.” 

 Section A, Paragraph 3- If a suppliers 
Q

uality C
ontro l Program

 had not been 
approved/certified by N

D
O

T for 2018 is 
hereby am

ended to “2021”.  
 Section A, paragraph 4- Supplier provision 
of docum

entation.  “John G
ude, (402)479-

4774 
or 

john.gude@
nebraska.gov " 

is 
hereby am

ended to “Asad Sahak (402) 
479-47 74 

or 
asadullah.sahak@

nebraska.gov.”  
 Section B Paragraph 2-  For questions or 
inform

ation 
on 

Supplier 
C

ertifications 



 

Page 3 

contact “John G
ude at 402-479-4774” is 

hereby am
ended to  “Asad Sahak, (402)-

479-4774 
or  

Asadullah.sahak@
nebraska.gov.” 

 
6 

 
32 

 Q
uestions 6, Page 

32 Special 
Provisions, Section 
B

. Supplier 
C

ertification: 
Suppliers w

ere told 
to N

O
T send daily 1 

quart/liter Q
C

 
sam

ples daily 
several years ago.  
D

o you w
ant to go 

back to daily 
sam

ples by product 
shipped or is your 
Field Q

A
/Q

C
 

program
 w

orking 
w

ell enough? O
m

it 
this paragraph?  

 

Section V Special Provisions for Liquid 
Asphalt M

aterials. 
 Page 32 Special Provisions section B, 
paragraphs 3 & 4 is hereby am

ended to 
delete/rem

ove- “A C
ertified Supplier m

ust 
agree 

to 
on-site 

inspect ion 
of 

their 
laboratory by the D

epartm
ent at any tim

e. 
Inspection of calibration of equipm

ent, 
review

 
of 

records, 
and 

technicians’ 
dem

onstration 
of 

procedures 
m

ay 
be 

required and review
ed during inspection.”  

 “Send a 1 quart/liter Q
C

 sam
ple of any 

new
 batch of em

ulsion or cutback of w
hich 

any 
portion 

is 
delivered 

for 
N

D
O

T 
contractual 

purposes 
to 

the 
N

D
O

T 
Bitum

inous Lab to arrive w
ithin 3 business 

days of first Page 33 SPB ITB Boilerplate | 
07012019 delivery. Another Q

C
 sam

ple 
w

ill be sent any tim
e an existi ng batch 

supplied for contract purposes is altered, 
changed or m

odified in any w
ay. A C

.O
.A. 

show
ing test results, specifications, and 

batch 
num

ber 
represented, 

w
ill 

accom
pany each sam

ple.”   
 And is replaced by: 
 “N

D
O

T 
M

aintenance 
Staff 

w
ill 

ship 
sam

ples for testing based on current 
N

D
O

T Sam
pling G

uideline.”  
7 

 
33 

Q
uestion #7: Page 

33 Special 
Provisions, Section 
B

. Supplier 
C

ertification: 
“Sam

ples that have 
frozen during 
transport to the 
N

D
O

T B
itum

inous 
Laboratory w

ill 
have the testing 
requirem

ents 
w

aived.”  This 

Page 33 Section B, paragraph 9 is hereby 
am

ended to delete/ rem
ove:  

Sam
ples that have frozen during transport 

to the N
D

O
T Bitum

inous Laboratory w
ill 

have the testing requirem
ents w

aived.   
 and is replaced w

ith:  
“Frozen sam

ples, or sam
ples collected 

w
ithout 

follow
ing 

the 
proper 

N
D

O
T 

sam
pling guidelines w

ill not be tested for 
acceptance.”   



 

Page 4 

pertains to field 
sam

ples sent to the 
B

itum
inous Lab.  

W
e w

ould like 
language added after 
the w

ord frozen to 
be “or m

ishandled 
or im

proper 
containers”? 

 
8 

Section 
504 

and 
513 

37 
Q

uestion #8: Page 
37 D

. Section 504 
and 513. Item

 6: at 
the end it says 
“Insert each 
specification 
com

ponent here”.  
W

as there a m
issing 

table or 
specification that 
w

as to be added? 

 

Section VI, Page 37, Section 504 and 513, 
Item

 
6 

is 
hereby 

am
ended 

to 
delete/rem

ove “Insert each specification 
com

ponent here.”  

9 
F 

37 
Q

uestion #9: Page 
37 F. Em

ulsified 
A

sphalt (C
R

S-2P 
and C

R
S-2P 

80/20Energy Star 
Products:  W

hat is 
Energy Star 
Products? It also 
references 
A

A
SH

TO
 M

-316 
w

ith m
ore testing 

param
eters.  

A
A

SH
TO

 M
-316 

w
as updated in 2018 

changing som
e of 

the testing 
requirem

ents.  D
o 

you w
ant A

A
SH

TO
 

M
-316-13 or 

A
A

SH
TO

 M
-316-

18? 

Section VI, Page 37 F. is hereby am
ended 

to delete/rem
ove the w

ording “Energy Star 
Products.” 
   Section VI, Page 37 F #1 Is hereby 
am

ended to delete/rem
ove “AASSH

TO
 M

-
316” w

ith the follow
ing changes:  and be 

replaced w
ith: 

“AASH
TO

 M
 316 2018 w

ith the changes 
listed in Special Provision.” 



 

Page 5 

 
10 

O
 

42 
Q

uestion #10: Page 
42 Section O

. 
Q

uality C
ontrol 

Program
 

C
ertification Status:  

D
oes the 2020 date 

need to be changed 
to 2021? 

 

Section VI, page 42, Section O
 Item

 1-  
“Vendor 

has 
current 

2020 
N

D
O

T 
certification approval for Q

uality C
ontrol 

Program
   is hereby am

ended to “2021” 
Section VI, page 42, Section O

 Item
 2- 

“Vendor does not have a current 2020 
N

D
O

T 
certification 

approval 
but 

has 
subm

itted Q
uality C

ontrol Pla n w
ith bid 

response   Is hereby am
ended to “2021” 

 Section VI, page 42, Section O
 Item

 3- 
“Vendor has not subm

itted current 2020 
Q

uality C
ontrol plan w

ith bid response”,  
is hereby am

ended to “2021” 
     

11 
 

 
Q

uestion #11: H
ow

 
w

ill w
e be able to 

get all B
id R

esults 
the day of the 
letting?  Page 2 of 
Procurem

ent 
Procedure indicates 
a Zoom

 m
eeting 

w
ith a date of 

January 21, 2021.  
A

re w
e allow

ed to 
attend in person on 
February 25th?  

 

The bid results w
ill be view

able during the 
zoom

 m
eeting on bid opening day.  

 The zoom
 m

eeting date is answ
ered via 

addendum
 Tw

o and Three.  
 D

ue to C
ovid 19 there w

ill not be an in 
person bid opening.  The bid opening w

ill 
be via Zoom

.  

12 
 

 
W

hat w
as the actual 

tonnage by product 
and by D

istrict that 
w

as used in 2020?  

 

See Answ
er to Q

uestion 2. 

  
R

evised Schedule of Events 
 The State expects to adhere to the tentative procurem

ent schedule show
n below

.  It should be noted, 
how

ever, that som
e dates are approxim

ate and subject to change.  It is the Bidder’s responsibility to check 
the State Purchasing Bureau w

ebsite for all addenda or am
endm

ents. 
 



 

Page 6 

 

4. 

Electronic Bid O
pening 

 Electronically subm
itted bids are being accepted due to the 

challenges of C
O

VID
-19. 

 U
pload electronic subm

issions via ShareFile to: 
 https://nebraska.sharefile.com

/r-
r24eda36eb2f14de8bfd2ed0a24dcbe9a 
  Topic: 6457 O

F R
oad O

il Bid O
pening 

Tim
e: M

arch 5, 2021 02:00 PM
 C

entral Tim
e (U

S and C
anada) 

 Join Zoom
 M

eeting 

https://us02w
eb.zoom

.us/j/2629176739?pw
d=N

khobXN
pO

U
94U

m
F

m
TG

1w
Ym

JqTXhpU
T09 

 M
eeting ID

: 262 917 6739 

Passcode: 5Vw
BuR

 

  IT IS TH
E B

ID
D

ER
’S R

ESPO
N

SIB
ILTY TO

 U
PLO

A
D

 
ELEC

TR
O

N
IC

 FILES W
ITH

 EN
O

U
G

H
 A

M
O

U
N

T O
F TIM

E IN
 

C
A

SE O
F U

SER
 ISSU

E O
R

 SO
FTW

A
R

E ISSU
E. 

3-5-21 
2:00 PM

 
C

entral Tim
e 

 
R

evised ITB
 

 
Follow

ing are revisions for the above m
entioned Invitation to Bid.  The changes are to be 

considered as part of the Invitation to Bid.  It is the Bidder’s responsibility to check the State 
Purchasing Bureau w

ebsite for all addenda or am
endm

ents   
 

 
Section V

, Page 30 #3, line 4 is hereby am
ended to delete/rem

ove “us” 
 

Section V, Page 30, #4, line 5 is hereby am
ended to delete/rem

ove “(See the paragraph on 
C

O
LD

 M
IX W

IN
D

R
O

W
S

—
M

IX D
ESIG

N
 below

)” 

 
ITB”s  posted on 2-3-21 and 2-16-21 are hereby rem

oved and replaced w
ith ITB posted 

on 2-23-21. 
 

 This Addendum
 w

ill becom
e part of the proposal and should be acknow

ledged w
ith the ITB. 



District 1
Estim

ated Requirem
ents (tons)

CRS-2 (Straight)
CRS-2L

CRS2-P
CRS2-P

CRS-2VHL
CSS-1H

CSS-1H 
CSS-1H 

80/20
75/25

50/50
Plant Pick up

25
25

25
25

25
25

25
25

David City
1463.82

Greenw
ood

136.97
Lincoln - Superior

Sew
ard

187.33
W

ahoo
Beatrice

243
Blue Springs
Dorchester

202
Fairbury

220
Lincoln - Salt Valley

255
Paw

nee City
278

W
ilber

Auburn
524

Eagle
Falls City

Nebraska City
410

Palm
yra

296
Syracuse

Tecum
seh

143
25

25
4,384

25
25

25
25

25

CRS-2 (Straight)
CRS-2L

CRS2-P
CRS2-P

CRS-2VHL
CSS-1H

CSS-1H 
CSS-1H 

80/20
75/25

50/50
Plant Pick up

25
25

25
25

25
25

25
25

O
m

aha - Dom
e

Om
aha - M

orm
on Bridge

O
m

aha - South
Blair

Frem
ont

Elkhorn
M

anley
M

elia Hill
Plattsm

outh
25

25
25

25
25

25
25

25

CRS-2 (Straight)
CRS-2L

CRS2-P
CRS2-P

CRS-2VHL
CSS-1H

CSS-1H 
CSS-1H 

80/20
75/25

50/50
Plant Pick up

25
25

25
25

25
25

25
25

LIQ
UID ASPHALT

District 2

District 3



Albion
1413

Clarkson
Colum

bus
25

341
Hum

phrey
938

Schuyler
204

Bloom
field

400
Neligh

300
Niobrara

375
Plainview

500
Norfolk

1205
15

W
est Point

94
15

Dakota City
Lyons

443
S Sioux City

57
Crofton

1094
Hartington

138
Laurel

601
New

castle
228

W
ayne

540
15

50
25

8896
25

25
70

25
25

CRS-2 (Straight)
CRS-2L

CRS2-P
CRS2-P

CRS-2VHL
CSS-1H 

CSS-1H 
CSS-1H 

80/20
75/25

50/50
Plant Pick up

25
25

25
25

25
25

25
25

Central City
228

Fullerton
75

Greeley
80

Loup City
738

O
rd

St Paul
599

Geneva
375

Hebron
750

O
sceola

150
Strang
York

200
Grand Island

100
Kearney (I-80)

395
Kearney (Hw

y-30)
217

Ravenna
266

Shelton
Aurora

225
Ayr

Harvard
Hastings

1000
Red Cloud

200

District 4



Superior
375

25
25

5998
25

25
25

25
25

CRS-2 (Straight)
CRS-2L

CRS2-P
CRS2-P

CRS-2VHL
CSS-1H

CSS-1H 
CSS-1H 

80/20
75/25

50/50
Plant Pick up

25
25

25
25

25
25

25
25

Chadron
225

75
Craw

ford
500

75
Gordon
Harrison

Hem
ingford

Bridgeport
400

75
Gering

325
225

O
shkosh

200
Chappell

125
25

Harrisburg
Kim

ball
Sidney

575
75

25
25

350
25

2050
25

25
575

CRS-2 (Straight)
CRS-2L

CRS2-P
CRS2-P

CRS-2VHL
CSS-1H

CSS-1H 
CSS-1H 

80/20
75/25

50/50
Plant Pick up

25
25

25
25

25
25

25
25

Gothenburg
Lexington
M

axw
ell

105
North Platte (I-80)
North Platte (W

-30)
498

143
Sutherland

W
allace

177
Big Springs

O
gallala

177.24
Lake M

ac (Brule)
Paxton
Ansley
Arnold

Broken Bow
935.33

336.52
O

conto
Arthur

139
50

Hyannis
33

M
ullen

491
232

Stapleton
267

2567
Thedford

25
25

2709.57
25

25
25

3243.52
273

District 5

District 6



CRS-2 (Straight)
CRS-2L

CRS2-P
CRS2-P

CRS-2VHL
CSS-1H

CSS-1H 
CSS-1H 

80/20
75/25

50/50
Plant Pick up

25
25

25
25

25
25

25
25

Alm
a

Franklin
Holdrege

25
M

inden
Arapahoe

389
Elw

ood
464

M
ayw

ood
204

M
cCook

115
25.5

Benkelm
an

Grant
Im

perial
228

25.5
Palisade

230
25

25
1655

25
25

101
25

25

CRS-2 (Straight)
CRS-2L

CRS2-P
CRS2-P

CRS-2VHL
CSS-1H

CSS-1H 
CSS-1H 

80/20
75/25

50/50
Plant Pick up

25
25

25
25

25
25

25
25

Ainsw
orth

420
155

Bassett
Springview

170
65

*Am
elia

75
Atkinson
Bartlett

375
Burw

ell
220

Naper
*Nenzel
O

'Neill
800

*Sparks
Spencer

425
Taylor

155
Cody

M
errim

an
140

66
Valentine

443
139

25
25

3248
25

25
25

450
25

District 7

District 8



SS-1H
SS-1H 

SS-1H
CFS/FS-1

CM
S-1

CM
S-1W

M
C-250

HFE-150
HFE300

HFE 500
HFE-1000

 75/25
50/50

25
25

25
25

25
25

25
25

25
25

25

25
25

25
25

25
25

25
25

25
25

25

SS-1H
SS-1H 

SS-1H
CFS/FS-1

CM
S-1

CM
S-1W

M
C-250

HFE-150
HFE300

HFE 500
HFE-1000

 75/25
50/50

25
25

25
25

25
25

25
25

25
25

25

25
25

25
25

25
25

25
25

25
25

25

SS-1H
SS-1H 

SS-1H
CFS/FS-1

CM
S-1

CM
S-1W

M
C-250

HFE-150
HFE300

HFE 500
HFE-1000

 75/25
50/50

25
25

25
25

25
25

25
25

25
25

25

ATTACHM
EN

T A
TIC M

ATERIALS ESTIM
ATED USAGE

Estim
ated Requirem

ents (tons)

Estim
ated Requirem

ents (tons)



5.13

5.13

5.13

25
25

25
25

25
25

25
40.39

25
25

25

SS-1H
SS-1H 

SS-1H
CFS/FS-1

CM
S-1

CM
S-1W

M
C-250

HFE-150
HFE300

HFE 500
HFE-1000

 75/25
50/50

25
25

25
25

25
25

25
25

25
25

25

25
154
128

250

2550

Estim
ated Requirem

ents (tons)



25
25

25
25

25
25

50
25

382
25

275

SS-1H
SS-1H 

SS-1H
CFS/FS-1

CM
S-1

CM
S-1W

M
C-250

HFE-150
HFE300

HFE 500
HFE-1000

 75/25
50/50

25
25

25
25

25
25

25
25

25
25

25

25

25
25

25
25

25
25

50
25

25
25

25

SS-1H
SS-1H 

SS-1H
CFS/FS-1

CM
S-1

CM
S-1W

M
C-250

HFE-150
HFE300

HFE 500
HFE-1000

 75/25
50/50

25
25

25
25

25
25

25
25

25
25

25

20
100
75

150

87.36

200

400
25

100
25

25
25

25
25

25
45

25
1137.36

25
50

Estim
ated Requirem

ents (tons)

Estim
ated Requirem

ents (tons)



SS-1H
SS-1H 

SS-1H
CFS/FS-1

CM
S-1

CM
S-1W

M
C-250

HFE-150
HFE300

HFE 500
HFE-1000

 75/25
50/50

25
25

25
25

25
25

25
25

25
25

25

25
25

25
25

25
25

25
25

25
25

25

SS-1H
SS-1H 

SS-1H
CFS/FS-1

CM
S-1

CM
S-1W

M
C-250

HFE-150
HFE300

HFE 500
HFE-1000

 75/25
50/50

25
25

25
25

25
25

25
25

25
25

25
20

100
100
50

275
2525

25
252550

25
18

50
25

300
25

25
25

25
25

68
45

475
25

75

Estim
ated Requirem

ents (tons)

Estim
ated Requirem

ents (tons)



HFM
S-2L

HFM
S-2P

25
25

25
25

HFM
S-2L

HFM
S-2P

2525
0

HFM
S-2L

HFM
S-2P

25
25



25
25

HFM
S-2L

HFM
S-2P

25
25



25
25

HFM
S-2L

HFM
S-2P

25
25

25
25

HFM
S-2L

HFM
S-2P

25
25

25
25



HFM
S-2L

HFM
S-2P

25
25

25
25

HFM
S-2L

HFM
S-2P

25
25

25
25



District 1
CRS-2 (Straight)

CRS-2L
CRS2-P

CRS-2VHL
CSS-1H

CSS-1H 75/25
CSS-1H 50/50

2020 Liquid 
Asphaltic 
M

aterial
3452.55

District 2
CRS-2 (Straight)

CRS-2L
CRS2-P

CRS-2VHL
CSS-1H

CSS-1H 75/25
CSS-1H 50/50

2020 Liquid 
Asphaltic 
M

aterial
4.14

District 3
CRS-2 (Straight)

CRS-2L
CRS2-P

CRS-2VHL
CSS-1H

CSS-1H 75/25
CSS-1H 50/50

2020 Liquid 
Asphaltic 
M

aterial
21.37

3176.42
31.64

District 4
CRS-2 (Straight)

CRS-2L
CRS2-P

CRS-2VHL
CSS-1H

CSS-1H 75/25
CSS-1H 50/50

2020 Liquid 
Asphaltic 
M

aterial
3458.83

District 5
CRS-2 (Straight)

CRS-2L
CRS2-P

CRS-2VHL
CSS-1H

CSS-1H 75/25
CSS-1H 50/50

2020 Liquid 
Asphaltic 
M

aterial
2250.15

127.52

District 6
CRS-2 (Straight)

CRS-2L
CRS2-P

CRS-2VHL
CSS-1H

CSS-1H 75/25
CSS-1H 50/50

2020 Liquid 
Asphaltic 
M

aterial
2985.14 TN

816.85 TN

District 7
CRS-2 (Straight)

CRS-2L
CRS2-P

CRS-2VHL
CSS-1H

CSS-1H 75/25
CSS-1H 50/50

2020 Liquid 
Asphaltic 
M

aterial
2913.07

74.35
108.13

District 8
CRS-2 (Straight)

CRS-2L
CRS2-P

CRS-2VHL
CSS-1H

CSS-1H 75/25
CSS-1H 50/50

2020 Liquid 
Asphaltic 
M

aterial
2626.89

129.34



SS-1H
SS-1H 75/25

SS-1H 50/50
CFS/FS-1

CM
S-1

CM
S-1W

M
C-250

HFE-150
HFE300

SS-1H
SS-1H 75/25

SS-1H 50/50
CFS/FS-1

CM
S-1

CM
S-1W

M
C-250

HFE-150
HFE300

SS-1H
SS-1H 75/25

SS-1H 50/50
CFS/FS-1

CM
S-1

CM
S-1W

M
C-250

HFE-150
HFE300

5.13

SS-1H
SS-1H 75/25

SS-1H 50/50
CFS/FS-1

CM
S-1

CM
S-1W

M
C-250

HFE-150
HFE300

24.35
414.75

SS-1H
SS-1H 75/25

SS-1H 50/50
CFS/FS-1

CM
S-1

CM
S-1W

M
C-250

HFE-150
HFE300

SS-1H
SS-1H 75/25

SS-1H 50/50
CFS/FS-1

CM
S-1

CM
S-1W

M
C-250

HFE-150
HFE300

46.3
423.5 TN

SS-1H
SS-1H 75/25

SS-1H 50/50
CFS/FS-1

CM
S-1

CM
S-1W

M
C-250

HFE-150
HFE300

SS-1H
SS-1H 75/25

SS-1H 50/50
CFS/FS-1

CM
S-1

CM
S-1W

M
C-250

HFE-150
HFE300

19.25
236.35

ATTACHM
ENT B

2020 PRO
DUCT USAGE BY  DISTRICT



HFE 500
HFE-1000

HFM
S-2L

HFM
S-2P

CRS-2P 80/20

HFE 500
HFE-1000

HFM
S-2L

HFM
S-2P

CRS-2P 80/20

HFE 500
HFE-1000

HFM
S-2L

HFM
S-2P

CRS-2P 80/20

HFE 500
HFE-1000

HFM
S-2L

HFM
S-2P

CRS-2P 80/20

HFE 500
HFE-1000

HFM
S-2L

HFM
S-2P

CRS-2P 80/20

HFE 500
HFE-1000

HFM
S-2L

HFM
S-2P

CRS-2P 80/20

HFE 500
HFE-1000

HFM
S-2L

HFM
S-2P

CRS-2P 80/20

HFE 500
HFE-1000

HFM
S-2L

HFM
S-2P

CRS-2P 80/20

1000




